Request for City Council Committee Action
From the Departments of Public Works and Procurement

Date: August 5" 2014

To: Honorable Kevin Reich, Chair Transportation & Public Works Committee
Referral to: Honorable John Quincy, Chair Ways & Means Committee

Subject: Approval of Official Publication No. 7924 Bids for Public Impound Towing

Recommendation:
Acceptance of the low bids as indicated below, for a total estimated annual expenditure of $1,975,140.33 to furnish public

impound towing for the Minneapolis Public Works — Transportation Division through June 30™, 2016, as follows.

Wrecker Services, Inc. (District A/Zone 3) for an estimated annual expenditure of $666,490.55
Raplid Recovety, Inc. (District B/Zone 5) for an estimated annual expenditure of $632,838.78

Corky’s Towing, Inc. (Zone 1 & Zone 4) for an estimated annual expenditure of $415,120.00

Twin Cities Transport and Recovery (Zone 2) for an estimated expenditure of $141,600.00

Williams Towing, Inc. (Zone 8) for an estimated annual expenditure of $119,691.00

Options to extend through June 30" 2018 and June 30" 2020 at the sole option of the City of Minneabolis.

Terms are net-30 days _ F.0.B.: Destination

Further recommend proper Officers be authorized and directed to execute a contract for this service, all in accordance with
our specifications.

» This has been approved by the Civil Rights Department.

Prepared by: Gary JAberg Director, Purchasing

Approved by: StevenA Kotk P.E D:rector of PubfigWorks

Financial Impact (Check those that apply)
___Nofinancial impact - or - Action is within current department budget.
(If checked, go directly to Background/Supporting Information)

__Aciion requires an appropriation increase to the Capital Budget

____Action requires an appropriation increase to the Operating Budget

____Action provides increased revenue for appropriation increase

____Action requires use of contingency or reserves

XX Other financial impact (Explain).  Action is within Budget

——Reguest-provided to the Budget Office when provided to the Committee Coordinator - - e




Honorable Kevin Reich
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Background/Supporting Information:
Tabulation of ten {10} bids received on Official Publication No. 7924 Bids for Public Impound Towing

Attachmenis -Tabulation Sheet

cc: E. Dosdall
J. Wertjes
S. Hengel
R. Crossland
L. Woyee




Minneapolis

City of Lakes

_w:..o_..mmm:m Division - Bid Tabulation Summary

o_l.m%\)

For the: AssistafTDirector, Purchasing

bficial Publication No.|7924
Bids for|Public Impound Towing
Purchasing Buyer: |David Schiueter
Department: | P/\W- Impound Lot
Department Contact: |Ellen Dosdall
Bigds Due: |\William Towing
|Corgan Transport Wrecker Services Rapi . . Twin Cities Transfer | Statewide Towing, ) Bobby & Steve's William
apid Recovery Inc. [ Schmit Towing Inc. Corky's Tawing .
Inc. Ine. & Recovery ne. Auto World Towing Inc. Chief's Towing

1 [DISTRICT A $iea 57.17 44 65 49.94 94.95 100.00 52.48 63.50 54.00 “no bid no bid

DISTRICTB $lea 64.17 53,75 58.94 no bid no bid 62.25 62.75 54.00 no bid no bid

ZONE 1 $lea :o.ui 112.00 122.50 i 109.36 no bid 165.00 155.00 110.00 no bid |no bid

ZONE 2 $ea no bid 114.00 122.50 124.93 150.00 155.00 150.00 110.00 160.00 |no bid

ZONE 4 $/ea no bid 123.50 122.50 no bid no bid 135.00 130.00 110.00 180.00 |no bid

ZONE 6 $/ea no bid 136.00 122.50 no bid no bid '200.00 200.00 110.00 143.00 144.00

Price for towing

outside of City
2 |Limits . $imile 75 1.80 3.00 5.00 5.00 2.00 4.00] 5.00 4.00|no bid

[
We, the yfidersigned, hereby certify




